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1. INTRODUCI'ION 

The space law-making process in the 
United Nations began in 1958, when the General 
Assembly of the United Nations established a 
special 18-member committee called the 
"Committee on the Peaceful Uses of Outer Space" 
(COPUOS), first as an ad hoc Committee of the 
General Assembly,1 and later, the following year, 
as a Permanent Committee, when the memhership 
was also increased to 24 member-States. 2 Sixty­
one States are currently memhers of the 
Committee. 3 

The Committee and its Scientific & 
Technical and Legal Subcommittees together have 
formulated five space treaties and four sets of 
legal Principles. The treaties are the Outer Space 
Treaty of 1967,4 which now has 93 Parties, the 
Rescue Agreement of 1968,5 with 83 Parties, the 
Liability Convention of 1972,6 with 76 Parties, 
the Registration Convention of 1976,7 with 38 
Parties, and, the Moon Agreement of 1979,8 with 
only 9 Parties. Each of these instruments, with the 
exception of the Moon Agreement, has been 
signed by over 100 countries. The four legal 
principles relating to outer space are the 
"Declaration" of space legal principles, and the 
Direct Ielevision Broadcasting, Remote Sensing, 
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and Nuclear Power Sourees Principles.9 

Thus, the United Nations has achieved 
considerable results in about three decades of 
space law-making, when compared to many other 
branches of international law, and a solid legal 
foundation has been laid by these treaties and 
principles. 

2. RECENT DEVELOPMENTS IN LAW­
MAKING ACI'IVITIES 

m Slow-down in the space law-making 
process 

In recent years, however, the space-law 
making process in the United Nations has 
gradually slowed down. The development of 
various factors have made it a very complex 
matter. For example, operational areas that now 
require regulation have become extremely 
technica! in nature. Space technology has 
proliferated due, in part, to the realization that 
space exploitation and use benefit not only a small 
minority of States, but the entire family of nations. 
There has been a dramatic shift from the emphasis 
on the use of space for civilian, as opposed to 
military, uses that has been caused, in part, by the 
end ofthe cold war. There has been a tremendous 
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world-wide increase of private entities using space 
for their own commercial ends. The developing 
countries are becoming increasingly involved in 
the use and exploitation of outer space. The 
resulting overall effect of ha ving a greater number 
of nations participating in the law-making process 
of the United Nations - some of whom have to 
take cognizance of the large financial stakes of 
their private entities involved in space activities -
aften on very technica) issues, have led to the 
process of law-making becoming tedious and 
time-consuming, with long, drawn-out 
negotiations and debates. 

([[) NPS Principles 

This was demonstrated, for example, 
during the discussions and negotiations on the 
Nuclear Power Sourees Principles, that were 
finalized only after a decade of sametimes 
tortuous debate and negotiations in the 
Committee. 10 In 1992, the General Assembly 
adopted a set ofPrinciples Relevant totheUse of 
Nuclear Power Sourees in Outer Space. 11 A key 
element of the Principles was the inclusion of a 
clause which recommended that they be opened 
for revision within two years after their adoption 
by the General Assembly,12 (i.e. in 1994) in order 
to consider revisions that might be required by 
new nuclear power applications and changing 
radiological proteetion standards. 

Although the issue was discussed in the 
1994 and 1995 sessions of bath the Scientific and 
Technica) and Legal Subcommittees, nodecision 
was taken to reapen the Principles for revision. 13 

In fact, bath Subcommittees agreed, at their 
sessions in 1995, that "at the present time, 
revision of the Principles was nat warranted",14 

although the item will be kept on bath their 
agendas for their sessions in 1996. If and when 
they are revised, however, the primary objective of 
the review process must be aimed at strengthening 
the guidelines through which NPS systems may be 
utilized safely and effectively. 15 The issue of space 
debris and its relationship with the safe use of 
NPS in outer space, may prove to be one of the 
more difficult items discussed during the review 
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process. One way to approach the problem would 
be to supplement the existing Principles with new 
provisions. This method, however, would still nat 
fully take into account newer and later 
technological developments in the field, and the 
danger could arise that they would become 
obsolete. The answer to this could lie in the 
development of international space standards and 
practices. 

{[//) De!inition and Delimitation of 
OuterSpace and the Character and Utilization 
o[the Geostationary Orbit 

Another area in which the space law­
making process had made little headway for many 
years was that of the "Definition and Delimitation 
of Outer Space and the Character and Utilization 
of the Geostationary Orbit" .16 However, 
reasonably substantial progress was made on this 
topic at the 1994 and 1995 sessions of the Legal 
Subcommittee. On the issue of the definition and 
delimitation of outer space, 17 two polarized views 
still prevail in the Legal Subcommittee. One view 
is that the question of delimitation is part of the 
more comprehensive legal question of the 
applicability of treaties, and that it is thus 
necessary to have a conventionally defined 
boundary between airspace and outer space. The 
contrary view is that the need for such a boundary 
has nat yet been established, and that in the more 
than 30 years ofthe peaceful exploration and use 
of outer space there has never been a practical 
problem caused by the Jack of a boundary between 
airspace and outer space, and that any attempt to 
establish such a boundary could cause more 
problems than it would solve. In an attempt to 
facilitate progress in consideration of this item, a 
questionnaire on aerospace objects was finalized 
at the 1995 session of the Legal Subcommittee. 18 

The purpose of the questionnaire is to seek the 
preliminary views of member States of the 
Committee on various issues re lating toaerospace 
objects, with the hope that the replies to the 
questionnaire would provide a basis for the Legal 
Subcommittee "to decide on how it might continue 
its consideration" ofthe agenda item. 19 Iffollowed 
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through, this would likely take a functional 
approach to the question. 

On the question of the geostationary 
orbit, which lies at a height of 22,400 miles 
(approx. 36,000 km) above the equator, it has 
generally been agreed that the orbit is a limited 
natural resource that should be used for the benefit 
of all humankind and that all countries should 
have equitable access to it. Two opposite view­
points are also prevalent on this issue. The first is 
put forward by developing countries or countries 
which have not had the financial or technica! 
resources to place a communications satellite in 
orbit. They say that the geostationary orbit 
requires a special legal regime to regulate access 
to and utilization ofthe orbit.20 Some countries, 
particularly those whose national territories lie 
along the equator ( equatorial countries ), have 
claimed that they should have speci_al access or a 
reserved right to this orbit. The opposing view is 
that the legal regulations ofthe geostationary orbit 
are inseparably linked with the freedom of outer 
space and should be governed by the 
determination of the International 
T elecommunication Uni on which has the sole 
competence for the coordination and regulation of 
the radio frequency spectrum. In addition, it has 
been argued that any type of reservation or an a 
priori claim to the geostationary orbit would 
amount to an appropriation of outer space which 
is prohibited under the Space Treaty, in Artiele 11. 

{IV) Outer Space Benefits 

The agenda item of "Outer Space 
Benefits", as the second pending issue is popularly 
called,21 has progressed well in the past two 
years.22 This agenda item aims for the 
development of a Ie gal regime that embodies and 
promotes the principle of Artiele I of the Outer 
Space Treaty, that the exploration and utilization 
of outerspace should be carried out for the benefit 
and in the interests of all States, taking into 
particular account the developing countries. This 
item is on the agenda because it is the view of 
many countries that there is a lack of any legal 
effort to ensure that space exploration and 
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application of space technology benefits all 
countries. Therefore, memher States are now 
looking to move beyond Artiele I of the Outer 
Space Treaty, possibly to codifY the rights and 
responsibilities of countries with respect to 
international cooperative space activities, and not 
let the Artiele stand, as some States view it, 
merely as an artifact or a moral appeal to the 
space-faring nations. 23 

Currently, there are three draft sets of 
principles before the Legal Subcommittee. The 
first, co-sponsored by several developing 
countries, 24 had formed the basis for discussions 
on this agenda item for some years. They are 
aimed at meeting the concrete needs and 
expectations of all countries, particularly those of 
developing countries. The central thrust of the 
draft Principles is that of the means of access by 
all countries - especially the developing countries -
to the benefits of space technology, and this, 
ultimately, is a question of the nature of 
international co-operation among States. In a 
more general sense, the co-sponsors are saying 
that they believe that the technological gap 
between the developed and the developing 
countries has become too vast and that they wish 
to reverse the trend, at least to some degree, by the 
application of these Principles. They also seem to 
say that they have lost their confidence in the 
moral appeals as embodied in the spirit of Artiele 
I of the Outer Space Treaty, and that the remedy 
lies in the establishment of an internationallegal 
framework regulating space co-operation and 
requiring the developed countries to co-operate 
within specified limits. 

Recently the developed countries have 
shown a willingness to discuss the matter, though 
somewhat reluctantly. At the 1994 session of the 
Legal Subcommittee, some delegations had 
expressed specific concerns regarding the draft 
Principles. One was the fact that, until now, a 
high level and long history of successful co­
operation in the peaceful uses of outer space has 
existed without the proposed principles. The 
delegations were also concerned that they could be 
put in a position where they would not have a 
choice as to which programme to open to co-
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operation and what information they could share 
with developing countries. Another concern 
related to the issue of adequate compensation for 
technology transfers. 

As a result of these discussions, France 
and Germany submitted a working paper at the 
1995 session ofthe Subcommittee.25 The paper 
rests on two basic considerations: "(i) first, that 
States are free to determine all aspects of their 
cooperation, whether it is bilateral or multilateral 
or whether it is commercial or non-commercial, 
including of course development cooperation; and, 
(ii) second, that States shall choose the most 
efficient and appropriate mode of cooperation in 
order to allocate resources efficiently."26 

The paper is divided into three short 
parts, the first which lays out general elements of 
international cooperation in the peaceful uses of 
space, the second describes the modes of such 
cooperation, and the third lists possible areas in 
which this cooperation could be carried out. 

Towards the end '6f 1995 session, the 
Chairman of the Working Group established to 
consider the matter in the Legal Subcommittee 
produced an informal working paper representing 
a merger based on the texts of the two working 
papers, with additionallanguage ofhis own, with 
the hope that the document would facilitate debate 
in the Working Group, in order to progress on the 
issue at its next session.27 

Another possible approach that might 
satisfy both positions would be to identify specific 
forms· of co-opera ti on that could be the subject of 
specific agreements. By gradually elaborating a 
series of fairly narrow agreements and by 
gradually converting these into binding form, a 
!ega! framework for international co-operation, 
basedon the spirit of Artiele I of the Outer Space 
Treaty, could progressively be developed. This 
process, whereby sorts of "standard contracts" 
would be developed, could be slow, but it might 
allow for possible success. 

3. RECENT DEVELOPMENTS IN 
SCIENTIFIC & TECHNICAL ACTlVITIES 

Recent developments in United Nations 
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scientific and technica! activities relating to outer 
space that could impact, in the future, on the space 
law-making field, include concerns about the 
safety of space activities, including the question of 
the space debris and protecting the space 
environment, and the possible convening of a 
Third United Nations Conference on the 
Exploration and Peaceful Uses of Outer Space 
(UNISPACE-III). 

{/) The Space Debris Issue 

The problem of space debris poses an 
increasing hazard to the exploration and 
utilization of space.28 After many years of 
discussions in the Committee and the Scientific 
and Technica! Subcommittee, the item of space 
debris became a separate agenda item at the 31st 
session ofthe S&T Subcommittee, in 1994.29 At 
this session, the Subcommittee began its 
consideration of the item and considered scientific 
research relating to space debris, including 
relevant studies, mathematica! modeling and othe~ 
analytica) work on the characterization of the 
space debris environment. During the discussions 
intheLegal Subcommittee later in the year,30 the 
matter of space debris was raised. Some 
delegations were of the opinion that an 
international agreement on the problem of space 
debris might be necessary in the future and they 
were ofthe opinion that the Subcommittee should 
begin consideration of the matter. This was 
opposed by those who thought that a !ega! 
discussion of the issue was premature and that the 
S&T Subcommittee should first be given time to 
thoroughly consider all the technica! and scientific 
aspects of the issue. Although these views were 
reiterated at the 1995 session of the Legal 
Subcommittee,31 the matter formed part of the 
informal discussions of the meeting, as the IISL 
organized, for the benefit of delegations, a !ega! 
Symposium on the .Technica/ and Policy Issues 
Related to the Use ofthe Space Environment. 32 

The Scientific and Technica! Subcommittee made 
further progress in its deliberations on this item at 
its 32nd session in 1995. It developed a multi-year 
plan, in order to advance in its consideration of the 
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matter at future sessions. 33 

(11) UNISPACE-111 

The developing countries have, for 
several years, been urging that a third United 
Nations Conference on the Exploration and 
Peaceful Uses of OuterSpace (UNISPACE-111) 
should be held. 34 Since Unispace '82,35 the 
international politica! situation has changed; 
tremenclous advances have been made in space 
technology and its applications and there is an 
increased awareness of their potential terrestrial 
benefits; and, there is growing recognition of the 
special role that space technology can play in 
areas of universa! concern, such as the 
environment and disaster warning, mi ti gation and 
relief, and the potential role of space technology in 
enhancing peace and security. These are some of 
the reasoos put forward to justifY the holding of a 
third UNI SP ACE Conference. The possible 
holding of a third such Conference was discussed 
at length at the 1994 and 1995 sessions of the 
Scientific & Technica! Subcommittee and 
COPUOS?6 As a result of the discussions, the 
Committee agreed, at its 1995 session, that "a 
third UNISPA CE conference could be held before 
the turn of the current century" ?7 The Committee 
is expected to make a final decision on the matter 
at its 1996 session. 38 

4. THE U.N. AND SP ACE LAW: A LOOK TO 
THEFUTURE 

The international community has 
established the basic framewerk for a law in outer 
space. It can look back, at the years that have 
passed since the space age began, and he satisfied 
with the work done to regulate the peaceful 
exploration and use of outer space. Now, however, 
the international community will have to seek new 
ways for space law-making, to keep up with the 
ever-rapid progression of space technology. As 
seen above, space debris and UNISPACE-III are 
two of the most important issues being currently 
debated in COPUOS. 
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m Lego/ Aspects o(Space debris 

Consiclering the debate in the Legal 
Subcommittee and the Committee, it would he 
sometime before international regulations are 
formulated to deal with this issue. It is possible, 
however, that existing space law can he applied to 
the space debris problem. There have been 
several proposals to deal with space debris that 
include applying existing principles of space law 
such as improving the requirements for 
information imposed by the Registration Treaty39 

and clarizying the Liability Convention so that it 
would refer to space debris. 40 Also, it may he 
possible, by relying on already existing principles 
of space law, to have a regulatory mechanism in 
the form of a body of recommended standards and 
practices which could he reviewed in COPUOS.41 

This will he discussed in greater detail below. 

(11) Estah/ishing International 
Standards and Recommended Practices.42 

As noted above, the rapid development of 
space technology is one primary reason why the 
evolution of space law has been affected, and the 
momenturn of space law legislation slowed down. 
Current space law-making procedures normally 
jointly regulate both the politica! and technica! 
aspects of a problem, and this is sametirnes 
resented by space-faring nations, who see this as 
stifling their activities in space. 

The remedy, then, would he to separate, 
as much as possible, the reguiatien of the poli ti cal 
and scientific/technical aspects of the use of space 
technology. One approach that not only would do 
this, . but would also promote greater 
standardization in technica! areas, would he the 
adeption of international space standards and 
recommended practices. · 

Space standards recommended practices 
would also make the existing space Treaties and 
Principles more meaningful. For example, the five 
outer space treaties lay out general !ega! rules 
without providing specific standards or 
procedures by which the treaties are to he 
implemented and by which space activities can he 
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controlled. In doing so, they create technica! and 
legal weaknesses in the treaties. To give just two 
examples: in the Outer Space Treaty, Artiele IX 
requires States to "adopt appropriate measures" so 
as to avoid the harmful contamination of the Earth 
and outer space environments while conducting 
space activities. However, the Treaty does not 
recommend the measures that are to he taken. 
Further, the Artiele establishes no standards or 
criteria as to what constitutes "harmful 
contamination", "adverse changes", or "harrnful 
interference" to the Earth or space environments. 
In the Liability Convention, procedures for 
rendering assistance as provided for in Artiele 
XXI (which deals with the large-scale danger to 
human life by damage caused by a space object on 
Earth) are not established.43 

More importantly, there are also new 
technica! issues such as N.P.S., on which 
principles have been adopted but work is 
continuing in COPUOS, and space debris, already 
under consideration in the S&T Subcommittee, 
which would need not only a high degree of 
technica! work but also where pace would have to 
be kept with rapidly advancing state of 
technology. 

To take account of these and other factors 
the time has perhaps come to look for new and 
innovative ways in space-law making. For 
instance, the international community might want 
to begin to earnestly look at the formulation - with 
the strong support of scientists and other experts -
for subjects of a more technica! nature, of easily 
amendable technica! standards and recommended 
practices for space activities. This will not only 
allow the law to keep pace with rapidly changing 
technology, but it will also fill gaps and 
weaknesses in, and supplement, the existing space 
law treaties and principles. The United Nations, 
through COPUOS, could follow the example set 
by international organizations such as the 
Montreal-based International Civil A viation 
Organization (ICA0),44 W.H.O. and I.M.O., and 
adopt international standards and practices for 
topics such as space debris, the outer space and 
Earth environments, safety of space operations, 
manned space flight, and space navigation. 

209 

An Expert Group of scientists and 
lawyers could be set up to work together. The 
Group could be a special standing group, either 
attached to the Scientific and Technica! 
Subcommittee or alternately, the Group could he 
established within the framework of a convention 
drafted to serve as the enabling legislation for 
such standard-setting. The Expert Group could 
then formulate international space standards and 
practices for topics like: the outer space and Earth 
environments, space debris, safety of space 
operations, search and rescue, operation of 
spacecraft, matcrials processing in space, 
aerospace planes, manned space flight, space 
navigation, and so on. One major benefit in the 
space law-making process that would result from 
this would he that the politica! and technica! 
aspects of space technology would he separated, 
and the future use of space science and technology 
would not he hindered by protracted politica! 
discussions. More importantly, this procedure 
would allow the law not only to keep up with the 
rapid.ly evolving technology connected with space 
science, exploration and use, but also to up-date it 
consistently, and keep it in line with the latest 
technology. 

{[//) Commercial U se of Outer Space 

Another topic that could he subject to 
international regulation by the United Nations in 
the future is that of international space commerce, 
which is rapidly proliferating.45 The legal 
implications of matters such as international 
commerciallaunch services,46 the liability aspects 
of such services, intellectual property rights,47 

insurance,48 product liability insurance and 
matcrials processing,49could one day be subject to 
regulation. In fact, the question of 
commercialization is linked to the question of 
sharing benefits of space activities, and this 
currently is an agenda item in the Legal 
Subcommittee. 

Laws formulated in an era when the word 
"privatization" had noteven been coined cannot 
contain potential problems caused by the 
increasing commercialization of outer space. A 
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recent newspaper report claims that the US Patent 
Office had "awarded a patent" to the American 
aerospace company TRW for its "invention ofthe 
'medium earth orbit'," from where a series of 
satellites would transruit telephone calls to any 
point on earth. 50 This is a good example of the 
uncertainty that lies ahead, in the absence of clear 
legal guidelines m the area of space 
commercialization. 

(IV) Manned Space Flight 

International space flights have become 
so camman that they do nat dominate newspaper 
headlines, as they once did. The major space­
faring countries have been making gradual 
progress in their plans for establishing a 
permanently manned international space station. 
Arnbitious projects for the further exploration of, 
and settiement on, the Moon and Mars are being 
planned. However, there is a Jack of a substantive 
body of international regulation with regard to 
manned space flight, notwithstanding applicable 
provisions in existing space law. When 
humankind does realize its ambitions and 
ventures further into space, comprehensive rules 
would he neerled to regulate international manned 
space flight. 51 

(V) Other Matters 

Other future space applications that will 
need well-formulated international regulation 
include the planned global navigation satellite 
system (GNSS) for civil aircraft, the proposed 
hand-held mobile communications systems, for 
example, that bas been proposed by Inrnarsat, and 
COPINE, the planned "Cooperative Information 
Network Linking Scientists, Educators and 
Professionals in Africa". 

Plans have been developed for satellite­
based civil aircraft navigation systems such as 
ICAO's Communication, Navigation, 
Surveillance/Air Transport Management system 
(CNS/ATM) to improve on the existing terrestrial 
air navigation system, the basic structure of which 
bas remained unchanged since its adoption shortly 
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after the Second World War. Although it has been 
modified several times since then, to keep pace 
with development in technology, modem advances 
in air transport technology, traffic growth 
requirements and increased use of long-distance 
aircraft for passenger and cargo carriage bas 
necessitated the implementation of an air 
navigation system that would last well into the 
next century. This task was taken up by the 
International Civil Aviation Organization (ICAO), 
which established, in 1983, a Special Committee 
on Future Air Navigation Systems (FANS), which 
concluded, in genera!, that only a satellite-based 
navigation system could adequately tackle the 
growing needs of current and future international 
civil aviation. Thus was bom the CNS/ A TM 
systems. 52 The CNS/ A TM systems are expected 
to complement the current Instrument Landing 
System (ILS), and the futuristic Microwave 
Landing System (MLS). There is still some way to 
go, however, befare the legal institutional 
arrangements to implement the systems are 
complete. 53 

Further, although plans are also being 
made to set up global mobile telephone systems,54 

the !ega! aspects of these systems are yet to he 
fully explored. For example, the International 
Mobile Satellite Organization (lnrnarsat)55 

recently announced its intention to inaugurate 
personal satellite communications services by the 
end of this century. 56 Inrnarsat bas therefore 
created an affiliate structure to handle the 
"Inrnarsat-P" global mobile telephone system 
business. The affiliate bas been tentatively named 
"I-CO Global Communications Ltd.". 57 The 
affiliate aims to have launched 12 satellites into 
intermediate orbit by the end ofthis century,58 that 
would fully enable it to meet its basic service 
objective, which is to reproduce, as closely as 
practicable, the service characteristics of 
terrestrial cellular handheld telephones in outdoor 
environments. 

Another future space application that 
would require !ega! regulation is COPINE, the 
planned satellite-based information system that 
would link scientists, educators and professionals 
in Africa. Initially, it would aim at improving the 
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collection, transmission, distribution and 
exchange of infonnation particularly in areas such 
as science and technology, agricultural research 
and development, management of natura) 
resources and the environment and health-care and 
education, within and among participating African 
countries as well as within the international 
community. The technica) aspects of the system 
are still being discussed. Once finalized, the 
regulatory aspects of the system would need to be 
addressed, befare the system is fully implemented. 

(VI) Policv & Legal Issues at 
UNISPACE-IJI 

If, indeed, a UNISPACE-lii is convened, 
the possible space policy and legal issues that 
could be covered may include a review of policy 
and legal matters affecting international 
cooperation in space activities, a review of the 
current status and the need for continued 
progressive development and codification of the 
law of outer space, establishment of guidelines for 
international cooperation in space exploration and 
utilization, and examination of links between 
space law and other branches of internationallaw, 
such as environmentallaw. An important decision 
for UNISPACE III would be to initiate the process 
for establishing international space standards and 
recommended practices. 

CONCLUSIONS 

During the first twenty years of 
COPUOS, five treaties and four sets of legal 
principles were negotiated and adopted, an 
unprecedented rate for law-making in international 
law. More recently, however, the momenturn of 
space law legislation has slowed down. The space 
law-making process has become extremely 
complex. It has now begun to focus on specific 
areas of space technology, its applications and 
scope rather than on the general public 
internationallaw principles that were promulgated 
at the beginning of COPUOS. Thus, the law for 
space activity now requires more clarification and 
precision for addressing an extremely 
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sophisticated and diverse space industry, 
especially one that has become so privatized and 
commercially intense. 

The interests and will of States to 
negotiate and promate international cooperation in 
space exploration and utilization, however, 
continues. Therefore, although its focus may be 
more specific, it appears that the United Nations 
and the Committee on Peaceful Uses of Outer 
Space will remain essential fora for the 
development of international space law. 

Nevertheless, important fora such as the 
International Institute of Space Law can make a 
substantial contribution to future space law by 
continuing to provide an input to the deliberations 
ofthe Committee, bath inside the meetings ofthe 
Legal Subcommittee of COPUOS, and outside 
these meetings at its annual colloquia, through 
legal papers submitted by its members. Of 
particwar note is the contri bution that the IISL has 
been making over the years, to the debates in the 
Legal Subcommittee of COPUOS, by organizing, 
during Subcommittee sessions, legal Symposia on 
space-related matters. This gives the delegations 
an account of the latest developments and 
important legal issues involved in various space 
activities. It is hoped that this association will nat 
only continue, but will strengthen considerably, in 
the future. 

ENDNOTES 

I. G.A. Res. 1348 (XIII) of 13 December 1958, 
by which the General Assembly, "[c]onsidering that an 
important contribution (could) be made by the 
establishment within the framework of the United 
Nationsof an appropriate international body for co­
operation in the study of outer space for peaceful 
purposes", set up the 18-Member State ad hoc 
Committee on the Peaceful Uses of Outer Space. The 
Committee was requested to report to the General 
Assembly on, inter a/ia, the following: The activities 
and resources ofthe United Nations, ofits specialized 
agencies and of other international bodies relating to 
the peaceful uses of outer space; the nature of !ega! 
problems which may arise in the carrying out of 
programmes to explore outer space; and, the future 
organizational arrangements to facilitate international 
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co-operation in this field within the framework of the 
United Nations. 

2. See, G. A. Res. 1472A (XIV) of 12 
December 1959 which established the permanent 
Committee. 

3. Gradual increases over the years have 
brought the memhership of COPUOS to 61 States. 
G.A. Res. 1721 E (XVI) of 20 December 1961 
increased the number to 28; G.A. Res. 3182 (XXVIII) 
of 18 December 1973 increased it to 37; and G.A. 
Res.32/J96 of20 December 1977 increased it to 47. 
The General Assembly, by Resolution 35/16 of 3 
November 1980 and by its decision 45/315 of 1990, 
increased the memhership of the Committee to 53 
Memher States. At its 49th Session in 1994, the 
General Assembly, by Resolution 4 9/3 3 of 9 December 
1994, increased this number to 61. Thus, the following 
States are memhers of COPUOS (the italics indicate 
the 8 States that became memhers in 1994. The 
Turkey-Greece and Portugai-Spain rotating 
memhership scheme ceased when the current "sitting" 
members, Greece and Spain and their altemates, 
Turkey and Portugal, got "full" memhership status in 
1994): Albania, Argentina, Australia, Austria, 
Belgium, Benin, Brazil, Bulgaria, Burkina Faso, 
Cameroon, Canada, Chad, Chile, China, Colombia, 
Czech Republic, Ecuador, Egypt, France, Germany, 
Greece, Hungary, India, Indonesia, Iran (lslamic 
Republic of), Iraq, Italy, Japan, Kazakhstan, Kenya, 
Korea, Lebanon, Mexico, Mongolia, Morocco, 
Netherlands, Nicaragua, Niger, Nigeria, Pakistan, 
Peru, Philippines, Poland, Portugal, Romani a, Russian 
Federation, Senegal, Sierra Leone, South Africa, 
Spain, Sudan, Sweden, Syrian Arab Republic, Turkey, 
Ukraine, United Kingdom of Great Britain and 
Narthem Ireland, United Statesof America, Uruguay, 
Venezuela, Viet Nam and Yugoslavia. Korea and 
Nicaragua will altemate, every three years, with 
Malaysia and Cuba, respectively. 

4. Treaty on Principles Governing the Activities 
of Stales in the Exploration and Use of Outer Space, 
Including the Moon and Other Celestial Bodies, 
Opened for signature at London, Moscow and 
Washington on 27 January 1967, entered into force on 
JO October 1967,610 U.N.T.S. 205; 18 U.S.T. 2410, 
T.l.A.S. 6347; ( 1967) 6 I.L.M. 386. 

5. Agreement on the Rescue of Astronauts, The 
Return of Astronauts and the Return of Objects 
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Launched into Outer Space, Opened forsignature at 
London, Moscow and Washington on 22 April 1968, 
entered into force on 3 December 1968, 672 U.N. T.S. 
119; 19 U.S.T. 7570, T.I.A.S. 6599, (1968) 7 I.L.M. 
151. In addition to the 83 State Parties, the European 
Space Agency (ESA) has declared its acceptance of 
the rights and obligations provided for in the 
Conven ti on. 

6. Convention on International Liabi/ity for 
Damage Caused by Space Objects, Opened for 
signature at London, Moscow and Washington on 29 
March 1972, entered into force on I September 1972, 
961 U.N.T.S. 187; 24 U.S.T. 2389, T.l.A.S. 7762. In 
addition to the 76 State Parties, the European Space 
Agency (ESA) and the European Telecommunications 
Satellite Organization (EUTELSAT) have declared 
their acceptance of the rights and obligations provided 
for in the Convention. 

7. Convention on Registration of Objects 
Launched in Outer Space, Opened for signature at 
New York on 14 January 1975, entered into force on 
15 September 1976, 1023 U.N.T.S. IS; 28 U.S.T. 695, 
T.l.A.S. 8480; (1975) 14 I.L.M. 43. In addition to the 
38 State Parties, the European Space Agency (ESA) 
has declared its acceptance ofthe rights and obligations 
provided for in the Convention. 

8. Agreement Governing the Activities of Stales 
on the Moon and Other Celestial Bodies, Opened for 
signature at New York on 18 December 1979, entered 
into force on IJ July 1984, 1363 U.N.T.S. 3; (1979) 
18 I.L.M. 1434. 

9. (a) The Declara/ion of Legal Principles 
Governing the Activities of Stales in the Exploration 
and Use of Outer Space, adopted on 13 December 
1963 (G.A. Res. 1962 (XVIII); (b) The Principles 
Governing the Use by Stales of Artificial Earth 
Satellites for International Direct Television 
Broadcasting, adopted on I 0 December 1982 (G.A. 
Res. 37/92); (c) The Principles Relating to Remote 
Sensing of the Earth from OuterSpace, adopted on 3 
December 1986 (G.A. Res. 41/65); and (d) The 
Principles Relevant to the Use of Nuclear Power 
Sourees in Outer Space, adopted on 14 December 
1992 (G.A. Res. 4 7 /68). These Principles and the five 
outer space treaties can be found in Uniled Nations 
Treaties and Principles on Outer Space, U.N. Doe. 
A/AC.IOS/572, ofMarch 1994. 
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I 0. See, N. Jasentuliyana, "Multilateral 
Negotiations on the U se ofNuclear Power Sourees in 
Outer Space" ( 1987) XIV Anna Is of Air and Space L. 
297, for the historica! background for placing the 
Principles on Nuclear Power Sourees on the agenda. 

IJ. Supra, note 9. The Principles begin by 
declaring that activities invalving the use of nuclear 
power sourees in outer space are to be carried out in 
accordance with intemationallaw (Principle I). They 
recognize that the use of nuclear power sourees may be 
essential to some space missions, but that such use 
involves some risk of accidental exposure to the pub !ie 
of hannful radiation or radioactive material (at the 
Preamble). Laying out guidelines and criteria for safe 
use, they state that, in order to minimize the quantity of 
radioactive material in space and the risks involved, the 
use of nuclear power sourees in outer space are to be 
restricted to those space missions which cannot be 
operated by non-nuclear energy sourees in a reasonable 
way (Principle 3). Nuclear reactors may be operated on 
interplanetary missions, in sufficiently high orbits, or in 
low-Earth orbits if they are stored in sufficiently high 
orbits after the operational part of their mission 
(Principle 3, para. 2(a)). Also they should not be made 
critical, and they should be designed and constructed to 
ensure they cannot become critica!, before reaching 
their operating orbit (Principle 3, paras. 2(d) & (e)). 
Radioisotape generators should be designed to be able 
to withstand atrnospheric re-entry and surface impact 
without spreading radioactive material into the 
environment (Principle 3, para. 3). The Principles 
oblige a State launching a nuclear power souree to 
make a thorough safety assessment of the mission and 
all systems involved, and to make the results of the 
assessment publicly available (Principle 4). In case of 
a malfunction of a space object with nuclear power 
sourees on board, with a risk ofre-entry ofradioactive 
materials to Earth, the Iaunching State is obliged 
inform other States and the Secretary-General of the 
United Nations, ofthis event (Principle 5), and provide 
assistance to eliminale any harmful effects caused by 
this re-entry (Principle 7). The NPS Principles, re­
staling basicprinciplesof space Iaw, note that States 
are intemationally responsible for national activities 
invalving the use of nuclear power sourees in outer 
space (Principle 8), and that a launching State is liable 
for any damage caused (Principle 9). 

12. Ibid. at Principle IJ. 
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13. See, Doe. A/AC. 105/571 of 10 March 1994, 
Report of the Scientiflc and Technica/ Subcommittee 
on the Workof its Thirty-First Session (21 February-
3 March 1994) at paras. 53-62 and Annex III 
[hereinafter S&T 3/st]; Doe. A/AC.I05/573 of 14 
Aprill994, Report ofthe Legal Subcommittee on the 
Work ofits Thirty-Third Session (21 March- 5 April 
1994) at paras. 23-30 and Annex I [hereinafter LSC 
33rd]; Doe. A/AC.I05/605 of 24 February 1995, 
Report of the Scientific and Technica/ Subcommittee 
on the Work of its Thirty-Second Session (6-16 
F ebruary 1995) at par as. 63-7 4 [hereinafter S&T 
32nd]; and, Doe. A/AC.I05/607 of 19 April 1995, 
Report ofthe Legal Subcommittee on the Workofits 
Thirty-Fourth Session (27 March -7 April 1995) at 
paras. 24-29 [hereinafter LSC 34th]. 

14. S&T 32nd, ibid. at para. 65 and LSC 34th, 
ibid. at para. 26. 

15. See, for greater detail, N. Jasentuliyana, "An 
Assessment of the United Nations Principles on the 
U se ofNuclear Power Sourees in Outer Space" ( 1993) 
36 Colloquium on the Law of OuterSpace 312. 

16. The full title of this item is: "Matters relating 
to the definition and delimitation of outer space and to 
the character and utilization of the geostationary orbit, 
including consideration of ways and means to ensure 
the rational and equitable use of the geostationary orbit 
without prejudice to the role of the International 
Telecommunication Union". 

17. In the United Nations, the Ad Hoc 
Committee, in 1959, frrst considered the question of the 
definition of outer space and it concluded that it was 
not a problem calling for priority consideration: see, 
Doe. A/4141 of 14 July 1959, Report of the Ad Hoc 
Cammillee on the Peaceful Uses of OuterSpace at 25 
[hereinafter Doe Al 4141]. The matter was 
subsequently raised off-and-on in the early sessions of 
the Legal Subcommittee, without any substantial 
result. Eventually, the General Assembly, in its 
resolution 2222 (XXI) of 19 December 1966 requested 
COPUOS "to begin ... the study of questions relative to 
the definition of outer space ... ". The question of the 
definition of outerspace was put on the agenda ofthe 
sixth session of the Legal Subcommittee under the 
rubric "Study of the questions relative to: (a) the 
definition of outer space; (b) the utilization of outer 
space and celestial bodies, including the various 
implications of space communications": see, Report of 
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the Legal Sub-Committee on the Work of its Sixth 
Session (19June- 14 July 1967) to the Committee on 
the Peaceful Uses ofOuterSpace, Doe. A/AC.I05/37 
of 14 July 1967, at para. 4( 4 ). The matter has been on 
the agenda ofthe Legal Subcommittee ever since, with 
the agenda item going through several changes in its 
title, until the LSC settled on the current version at the 
twenty-forth session of the Legal Subcommittee, in 
1985. 

For a review of the subject-matter of the 
definition/delimitation question, see, Doe. 
A/AC. 105/C.2n of 7 May 1970 and Doe. 
A/AC.I05/C.2n!Add. I of21 January 1977, The 
Question ofthe Definition andlor the Delimitation of 
Outer Space: Background Paper Prepared by the 
Secretariat. Fora comprehensive review ofboth topics 
of the agenda item, i.e. the definition question and the 
geostationary orbit matter, see e.g. N. Jasentuliyana, 
"The International Reguiatory Regime for Satellite 
Communications: The Meaning for Developing 
Countries" (1994) 2 Asian Yrbk. Int'/ L. 49; D. 
Goedhuis, "Some Observations on the Problem ofthe 
Definition and/or the Delimitation of Outer Space" 
(1977) II Anna Is Air & Space L. 287; B. Cheng, "The 
Legal Regime of Airspace and Outer Space: The 
Boundary Problem; Functionalism versus Spatialism: 
TheMajor Premises" (1980) VAnna/sof Air & Space 
L. 323; S. Misbra & T. Pavlasek, "On the Lack of 
Physical Bases for Defining a Boundary Between Air 
Space and Outer Space" (1982) VII Annals Air & 
Space L. 399; and, M. Benkö & W. de Graaff, 
"Questions Relating to the Definition/Delimitation of 
Outer Space and Outer Space Activities and the 
Character and Utilization ofthe Geostationary Orbit" in 
M. Benkö, W. de Graaff & G.G.M. Reijnen, Space 
Law in the United Nations (Dordrecht, The 
Netherlands: M. Nijhoff, 1985). 

18. At the 31 st session ofthe Legal Subcommittee 
in 1992, the delegation of the Russian Federation 
submitted a working paper (Doe. 
Al AC.I 05/C.2/L.I89) on questions conceming the 
legal regime foraerospace objects. At the 32nd session 
of the Subcommittee in 1993, the Chairman of the 
Working Group on agenda item 4 ofthe Subcommittee 
(definition of outer space and utilization of the 
geostationary orbit) circulated an informal working 
paper called "Draft questionnaire conceming aerospace 
objects" (Doe. A/AC. I 05/C.2/I 993/CRP.I ). The 
Chairman's paper was based on the Russian working 
paper, and contained questions both of a technica) and 
legal nature relating to aerospace objects. At its thirty-
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fourth session, the Working Group finalized the 
questionnaire, now entitled, "Questionnaire on possible 
legal issues with regard to aerospace objects" (Doe. 
A/AC.I05/C.2/1995/CRP.3/Rev.3 of31 March 1995, 
which still remains an Informal Working Paper 
Submitted by the Chairman of the Working Group): 
see, LSC 34th, supra note 13 at Annex I, appendix. 

19. LSC 34th, ibid. at Annex I, para. 29. 

20. See genera/ly, the Colombian working paper, 
"Geostationary satellite orbit" (Doe. 
A/AC. 105/C.2/L.I92 of 30 March 1993) which 
proposes principles for such a special regime. The 
paper was introduced by Colombia at the 32nd session 
of the Legal Subcommittee, held from 22 March-8 
April 1993. See, paras. 24-38 of Annex II of the 
Subcommittee's report (A/AC.IOS/544 of 15 April 
1993). The paper is annexed to the report. It can also 
be found in the reports to the 33rd and 34th sessions 
of the Subcommittee, held in 1994 and 1995, supra 
note 13. The paper seeks to ensure the rational and 
equitable use of the GSO. It has been submitted to 
develop legal principles, such as equity and efficacy, 
already norrus ofpositive law as contained in the ITU 
Convention and Regulations, and which regulated 
certain aspectsoftheuse ofthe GSO. The goal ofthe 
working paper is to find a legal salution to guarantee, 
in practice, equitable access to the Orbit, through the 
establishment of certain preferential rights for 
developing coun!Jies and coun!Jies that currently do not 
have access to the GSO, without prejudicing the 
technica! role of the ITU in this matter. At the 1995 
session of the Legal Subcommittee, the debate was 
constructive enough for the sponsor to deelare his 
intention of submitting, at the 1996 session of the 
Subcommittee, a revised version ofthe paper, as well 
as an annex giving an explanation ofthe ideas raised in 
the working paper. 

21. The full title of this agenda item is: 
"Consideration of the Iegal aspects related to the 
application of the principle that the exploration and 
utilization of outer space should be carried out for the 
benefit and in the interesis of all States, taking into 
particular account the needs of developing countries". 
See generally, N. Jasentuliyana, "Artiele I ofthe Outer 
Space Treaty Revisited", (1989) 17 J. Space L. 129. 

22. The Legal Subcommittee, at its 26th and 27th 
sessions held in 1987 and 1988, resp., considered and 
finalized the choice ofthis new item, before placing it 
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on the agenda at its 28th session, in 1989: see, Does. 
A/AC.I05/385, 411 and 430, being the reports ofthe 
26th to 28th sessions of the Legal Subcommittee. 

23. F or a detailed up-to-date discussion of this 
issue, see, N. Jasentuliyana, "Ensuring Equal Access to 
the Benefits of Space Technologies for all Countries" 
( 1994) I 0 Space Policy 7. 

24. See, LSC 34th, supra note 13, for the 
Working Paper jointly co-sponsored by Brazil, Chile, 
Colombia, Egypt, Iraq, Mexico, Nigeria, Pakistan, 
Philippines, Uruguay and Venezuela, "Principles 
Regarding International Cooperation in the Exploration 
and Utilization of OuterSpace for Peaceful Purposes" 
(Doe. A/AC.l 05/C.2/L.l82/Rev.2 of 23 March 1995). 
Principle I, after partly re-stating Artiele I, paragraph 
I, of the Outer Space Treaty, urges all Stales with 
space capabilities to promote cooperation with 
countries with less developed space capabilities. 
Pr~nciple II addresses the issue of ensuring equal 
access to the applications of space technology. 
Principle III primarily addresses the question of 
promoting indigenous capabilities in space science and 
technology application in developing countries through 
international cooperative mechanisms and Principle IV 
refers to the conditions under which such cooperation 
should be established and implemented. The need to 
utilize space technology and applications as a vehicle 
to proteet and preserve the Earth and space 
environments is covered by Principle V. The next 
Principle deals with the role ofthe Uniled Nations and 
its Progranune on Space Applications in international 
space cooperation. 

25. The paper, entitled, "Consideration of the 
legal aspects related to the application ofthe principle 
that the exploration and utilization of outer space 
should be carried out for the benefit and in the interesis 
of all States, taking into particular account the needs of 
developing countries" (Doe. Al AC.l 05/C.2/L.l97 of 
27 March 1995) is reproduced in LSC 34th, ibid. 

26. The statement by the German delegation at 
the 34th session of the Legal Subcommittee. See, 
A/AC. I 05/C.2/SR.584 of 5 April 1995. 

27. See, Informal Working Paper Submitted by 
the Chairman of the Working Group (Doe. 
A/AC.l05/C.2/1995/CRP.5 of 6 April 1995, as 
amended), entitled, "Working paper on a declamtion on 
international cooperation in the exploration and use of 

215 

outer space for the benefit and in the interesis of all 
States, taking into particular account the needs of 
developing countries," in LSC 34th, supra note 13. 

28. See, for example, H. Baker, "Current Space 
Debris Policy and its Implications" (1989) 32 
Colloquium on the Law of Outer Space 59; I.H.Ph. 
Diederiks-Verschoor, "The lncreasing Problem of 
Space Debris and their Legal Solutions" (1989) 32 
Colloquium on the Law of OuterSpace 77 [hereinafter 
Space Debris Solutions] and, C.Q. Christol, "Scientific 
and Legal Aspects of Space Debris" (1993) 36 
Colloquium on the Law of OuterSpace 368. 

29. See, S&T 3lst, supra note 13 at 12-13. 

30. See, LSC 33rd, supra note 13 at para. 19. 

31. See, LSC 34th, supra note 13, at para. 19. 

32. The papers presenled at the Symposium are 
reproduced elsewhere in this volume. 

33. See, S&T 32nd, supra note 13 at para. 83, 
which reads as follows: 

"In order to advance in its consideration of space 
debris, the following work plan was adopted by the 
Subcommittee: 

1996: Measurements of space debris. 
understanding of data and effects of this 
environment on space systems 

Measurements of space debris comprise all 
processes by which information on the near­
Earth particulate environment is gained 
through ground- and space-based sensors. 
The effect (impact of particulates and 
resulting damage) of this environment on 
space systems should be described. 

1997: ModeHing of space debris 
environment and risk assessment 

A space debris model is a mathematica! 
description of the current and future 
distribution in space of debris as a function of 
its size and other physical parameters. 
Aspects to be addressed are: 

• Analysis offragrnentation models 
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• Short- and long-tenn evolution of 
the space debris population 

• Comparison ofmodels. 

The various methods for collision risk 
assessment should be critically reviewe<l. 

1998: Space debris mitigation measures 

Mitigation camprises reduction ofthe space 
debris population growth and proteetion 
against particulate impact. Measures for the 
reduction of space debris growth include 
methods for debris prevention and removal. 
Proteetion against space debris includes: 

• Physical proteetion with shielding 
• Proteetion through collision 

avoidance. 

Each session should review the current operational 
debris mitigation practices and consider future 
mi ti gation methods with regard to cost efficiency." 

34. See, in particular, the working papers 
submitted by Pakistan ("Third United Nations 
Conference on the Exploration and Peaceful Uses of 
Outer Space": A/AC.105/C.l/L.l91 of 22 February 
1994), India ("Preliminary Concept Paper for 
UNISPACE-III": A/AC.105/C.l/L.l95 of22 February 
1994 and "Holding of a third UNISPACE 
Conference-Answers to a few key queslions": 
A/AC.I05/1995/CRP.9") and the Group of 77 
(A/AC.105/C.l/L.l99 of 2 March 1994). A/so see, 
A/AC.I05/575 and Add. I of 9 May 1994 and I 
December 1994, resp., "Matters Related to the Possible 
Holding of a Third United Nations Conference on the 
Exploration and Peaceful U ses of Outer Space: Report 
by the Secretariat". 

35. By the 1960s, the rapid growth of 
space technology, and ils potential for important 
applications, was already ciear. This led lo lhe 
convening in Vienna, in 1968, of the first Uniled 
Nations Conference on the Exploration and Peaceful 
Uses of Outer Space: See, "Space Exploration and 
Applicalions: Papers Presenled at the Uniled Nalions 
Conference on the Exploralion and Peaceful Uses of 
Outer Space, Vienna, 14-27 August 1968" (Uniled 
Nations, Sales No. E.69.I.l6, vols. I and 11). 
UNISPACE, as the Conference came lo be known, 
reviewed progress in space science, technology and 
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applications and called for increased international 
cooperation. As a result, the United Nations 
Programme on Space Applications was created in 1970 
to assist developing countries in using space-related 
technologies for development. The Space Applications 
Programme was mandated to ereale awareness on the 
part of policy makers and interested govemment 
agencies ofthe benefits that could be derived from the 
applications of space technology and to encourage 
training and education programmes to enable officials 
from developing countries to gain practical experience 
in these applications. 

Over the course of the 1970s, space 
applications programmes were developed by the 
United Nations and the specialized agencies concemed 
with telecommunications, meteorology, disaster 
waming and relief, environmental monitoring and 
remote sensing for agriculture, forestry, geology, 
cartography and other resource development 
applications. 

An updated review of the progress in space 
activities was conducted at the Second UNISPACE 
Conference, also held in Vienna, in 1982: See, 
genera/ly, UN Doe. A/CONF.! 0 I /10, and Corr. I and 
2, Report ofthe Second Uniled Nations Conference on 
the Exploration and Peaceful Uses of Outer Space, 
Vienna, 9-21 August 1982. The Conference gave a 
new impetus to the Programme on Space Applications, 
which was strengthened and oriented to promote 
indigenous capabilities in developing countries. Inter 
a/ia, the Programme was directed lo focus its attention 
on issues such as promotion of greater exchange of 
actual experiences with specific applications, 
promotion of greater cooperation in space science and 
technology between developed and developing 
countries as well as among developing countries, 
organization of seminars on advanced space 
applications for managers and leaders of space 
applications, dissemination of infonnation on new and 
advanced technologies and applications, with emphasis 
on their relevanee and implications for developing 
countries, and lhe provision of technica! advisory 
services on space applications projects, upon request 
by Memher Stales or any of the specialized agencies: 
See, GA Res. 3 7/90 of I 0 December 1982. 

36. See, S&T 3lst, supra note 13 at paras. 109-
116 and Annex 11, paras. 20-21; A/49/20, Report of 
the Committee on the Peacefu/ Uses of OuterSpace 
(6-16 June 1994) at paras. 144-149; S&T 32nd, supra 
note 13 at 129-131 and Annex 11, paras. 13-59; and, 
A/50/20, Report of the Cammillee on the Peacefu/ 
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Uses of OuterSpace ( 12-22 June 1995) at para. 157-
165. 

37. See, A/50/20, ibid. at para. 157. 

38. Ibid. at para. 163. 

39. See, Space Debris Solutions, supra note 28 at 
79 (referring to proposals by K.-H. Böckstiegel). 

40. Ibid. (referring toa proposal by T. Masson-
Zwaan). 

41. See, N. Jasentuliyana, "Space Activities and 
International Environrnental Protection: Perspectives 
on the United Nations Role" (1990) 33 Colloquium on 
the Law of Outer Space 152 at 154; and, N. 
Jasentuliyana, "Celebrating Fifty Years of the Chicago 
Convention Twenty-Five Years after the Moon 
Landing: Lessons for Space Law" (1994) XIX-U 
Annals Air & Space L. 429 [hereinafter Standards]. 

42. See, Standards, ibid., which is a detailed 
discussion on the issue of formulating international 
standards and recornrnended practices forspace law, 
based on those of the International Civil Aviation 
Organization (ICAO). 

43. Other examples are: (i) In the OuterSpace 
Treaty, 1967, Art. V calls on States to render 
astronauts assistance in the event of an accident, 
distress, or emergency landing, without giving the 
procedure to be foliowed for doing so; (ii) In the 
Rescue Agreement, 1968 the procedures to be 
foliowed in case assistance is rendered to astronauts in 
di stress, in case of search and rescue operations, and 
for other actions that may be taken under the treaty, are 
not elucidated; (iii) In the Registration Convention, 
1974, Art. VI would become more practical if 
standards had been established for the provision of 
assistance called for in the Article; further, the Jack of 
registration of space debris and chemica! and other 
pollutants and effusions released by space objects 
during or after launch, is a serious weakness in the 
Convention; (v) In the Moon Agreement, 1979, in 
Art. 7, the "measures" to be taken to prevent the 
disruption ofthe Moon environment arenotspelt out; 
further, no criteria defining the "harmful" 
contarnination ofthe Moon are provided; Standards and 
procedures for activities under Arts. 8 and 9 (the 
pursuit of activities on the Moon and the establishment 
of stations on the Moon, respectively) are not given; the 
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"practicable measures" for safeguarding life on the 
Moon, under Art. JO should be standardized; Art. IJ 
would have had more meaning if the international 
regime and the "appropriate procedures" in paragraph 
(5) had been more technically detailed. If the 
technicalities of the international regime of Art. 1 I had 
been fumished, the Moon Agreement could have 
become more acceptable to States; the consultation 
procedure envisaged in Art. 15 is not prescribed. 

lt could be said, however, that the 
Registration Convention does made provisions, to an 
extremely limited extent, for what may be called 
international space standards. These international 
"standards" are found in Art. IV of the Treaty, which 
reads as follows: 

I . Each State of registry shall 
furnish to the Secretary-General of 
the United Nations, as soon as 
practicable, the following 
information concerning each space 
object carried on its registry: 
(a) name of launching State or 
States; 
(b) an appropriate designator of the 
space object or its registration 
number; 
( c) date and territory or location of 
launch; 
( d) basic orbital parameters, 
including: 

(i) nodal period, 
(ii) inclination, 
(iii) apogee, 
(iv) perigee; 

( e) general function of the space 
object. 

[rest omitted] 

44. F or the setting of standards and recornrnended 
practices by ICAO, see Arts. 37, 38, 54(1), 57, and 90 
ofthe Convention on International Civil Aviation (the 
"Chicago Convention"), Opened for signature at 
Chicago, Illinois, on 7 December 1944, 15 UNTS 
295; ICAO Doe 7300/6. Over 180 States are Parties to 
the Chicago Convention. 

45. See, for example, S. Gorove, "Implications of 
InternationalSpace Law for Private Enterprise" (1982) 
VII Annals of Air & Space Law 319; K-H. 
Böckstiegel, "Commercial Space Activities: Their 
Growing Influence on Space Law" ( 1987) XII Anna is 
of Air & Space Law 17 5 ( 1987); and He Qizhi, "Leg al 
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Aspects of Commercialization of Space Activities" 
(1990) XV Anna Is of Air & Space Law 333. 

46. See, for example, P. Nesgos, "Commercial 
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